
 

 

A STATEMENT FROM REED EXHIBITIONS – ORGANIZERS OF EXPO SEGURIDAD MEXICO / EXPO 
SEGURIDAD INDUSTRIAL 

 

March 17, 2020, Mexico City. Today, Reed Exhibitions Mexico has announced that due to the uncertainty 

in the region and around the world, the Expo Seguridad Mexico and Expo Seguridad Industrial events, 

scheduled from April 21 to 23, will now take place from August 18 to 20, 2020 at Centro Citibanamex. 

 

The announcement was made following extensive consultation with all stakeholders and in alignment 

with the advice from the Mexican public health authorities regarding travel to and from impacted 

countries, and in addition to public authority advice to restrict gatherings of 5,000 people or more. 

Expo Seguridad is a 3-day trade show focused around the electronic and industrial security industry, with 
technology, solutions and education opportunities for domestic and international manufacturers, 
distributors, integrators and end users. 

Commenting on the announcement, Jorge Hagg, Show Director, stated, “All our thoughts are with those 
impacted by COVID-19. The decision to postpone the shows was a difficult one. Our customers, partners 
and staff have worked diligently to make this Expo Seguridad edition a reality. However, our top priority 
is to ensure the health and safety of all who are part of the events. We are confident that our rescheduled 
shows will continue to live up to the high standards participants have come to expect, and provide a vital 
service to the industry.  We will be offering business, collaboration, and education opportunities, and 
creating ways for the security community to connect, and keep the industry moving forward during this 
difficult period.   

“On behalf of Reed Exhibitions, I would like to express my sincere gratitude to all exhibitors, partners, 
attendees, suppliers, media, and staff for their support during this challenging time, and we look forward 
to welcoming the global security and public safety community to Mexico City in August,” Hagg concluded. 

For further information, please visit: https://www.exposeguridadmexico.com/es-mx.html or 
https://www.exposeguridadindustrial.com/es-mx.html 

Press contact: 
Sol Peña (Reed Exhibitions) 
+52 55 8852 6086 
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About Reed Exhibitions 

Reed Exhibitions is a leading global events business. It combines face-to-face with data and digital tools 
to help customers learn about markets, source products and complete transactions at over 500 events in 
almost 30 countries across 43 industry sectors, attracting more than 7 million participants.   
 
Our events, organized by 35 global offices, leverage industry expertise, large data sets and technology to 
enable our customers to generate billions of dollars of revenues for the economic development of local 
markets and national economies around the world.   Reed Exhibitions is part of RELX, a global provider of 
information and analytics for professional and business customers across industries. 
www.reedexhibitions.com 
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